—————————— Forwarded message -—--—---

Dari: <ojpr@centerprode.com>

Date: Sel, 2 Jun 2020 04.07

Subject: OJPR: APPROVAL FOR PUBLISHING
To: <yohanesb@fpsi.untar.ac.id>

Cc: COAS Main Office <office@centerprode.com>

OJPR: http://centerprode.com/ojpr.html

Dear Yohanes, we would like to inform you that your manuscript titled
"Why Know and Have Shame are Important? The Indonesian Adolescents’
Experience" is copy edited for publishing in the OJPR, based on
reviewers’ decisions.

All corrections in the texts are strictly done according to the COAS
Editorial Rules.

We kindly ask you to carefully preview pdf forms of your manuscript and
APPROVE IT for publishing, as soon as possible. You should pay special
attention at translations of Indonesian titles in the list of references

and check out if it is correctly done. Also, there is one problematic
position at page 26 (in red). Is it correct word nJawani and should be

put it in italic? If you will some suggestions for changes, please,

write them down in mail or in separate notepad.

Looking forward to hearing from you.
Best regards from Belgrade.
Goran Pesi¢

COAS Editorial Council
Vojvode Vlahovi¢a 57¢, 11000 Belgrade, SERBIA



"‘E‘T\ Yohanes Budiarto <yohanesb@fpsi.untar.ac.id>
tome «

—————————— Forwarded message --——--—--

From: Yohanes Budiarto <yohanesb@fpsi.untar.ac.id>
Date: Tue, Jun 2, 2020 at 6:38 AM

Subject: Re: OJPR: APPROVAL FOR PUBLISHING

To: <ojpr@centerprode.com>

Dear Goran PeSi¢
COAS Editorial Council

We thank you for the processes we are having. Attached is comment and corrections needed for the fina
attach the style of our affiliation writing based on the previous model published in OJPR. Thank you very

Sincerely yours,

Yohanes Budiarto
Universitas Tarumanagara
Universitas Gadjah Mada



—————————— Forwarded message ---------

Dari: <ojpr@centerprode.com>

Date: Sel, 26 Mei 2020 23.01

Subject: OJPR: Payment Received

To: Yohanes Budiarto <yohanesb@fpsi.untar.ac.id>

OJPR: http://centerprode.com/ojpr.html

Dear Yohanes, thank you very much for the information about payment. We
received a notification about payment from our bank, too.

We will send you copy edited text for your final approval for publishing
in the OJPR.

Best regards from Belgrade.

Goran PeSi¢

COAS Editorial Council

Vojvode Vlahovi¢a 57¢, 11000 Belgrade, SERBIA
Tel. +381 11 4253714

On 2020-05-26 08:18, Yohanes Budiarto wrote:

> Dear

> Goran PeSic

> COAS Editorial Council

>

> | am now again in different bank, now the transfer is possible. |
> hereby attach the scanned transfer copy. Thank you very much.
>

> Yours,



> Yohanes Budiarto
>

> Pada tanggal Kam, 21 Mei 2020 14.32, <ojpr@centerprode.com> menulis:
>

>> OJPR: http://centerprode.com/ojpr.html
>>

>> Dear Yohanes, thank you very much for the feedback.

>>

>> Yes, there is no problem for the publishing fee to be paid after 26
>> May.

>> Of course, now we continue with editing your text and preparing for
>> publishing.

>>

>> | ooking forward to hearing from you.

>>

>> Best regards from Belgrade.

>>

>> Goran Pesic

>> COAS Editorial Council

>> Vojvode Vlahovi¢a 57¢c, 11000 Belgrade, SERBIA

>>Tel. +381 11 4253714

>>

>> On 2020-05-21 01:26, Yohanes Budiarto wrote:

>>> Dear Goran Pe8i¢

>>> COAS Editorial Council

>>>

>>> We thank you for the information. Basically we agree to pay the
>> amount

>>> mentioned in the invoice. | have tried to pay it through Western
>>> Union, but it could not be done. The bank service in Indonesia
>> starts

>>> working again on 26 May 2020. We have times off from work this
>> week



>>> due to the big holy days of the Ascension Day and also Idul Fitri
>> (the

>>> Muslim's celebration day). The banks stop their services and the
>>> fransfer cannot be made if the bank is close, even if we do it on
>>> mobile banking. So, we can do it on the 26th of May 2020. We hope
>> this

>>> would not interfere with the publishing processes. Thank you for
>> your

>>> kind attention to this matter.

>>>

>>>Yours

>>>

>>> Yohanes Budiarto

>>>

>>> 0n Sun, May 17, 2020 at 10:14 PM <ojpr@centerprode.com> wrote:
>>>

>>>> OJPR: http://centerprode.com/ojpr.html
>>>>

>>>> Dear Yohanes, we would like to inform you that your manuscript
>>>> titled

>>>> "Why Know and Have Shame are Important? The Indonesian
>>>> Adolescents’

>>>> Experience" is accepted for publishing in the OJPR, based on
>>>> reviewers’

>>>> decisions.

>>>>

>>>> We send you the OJPR Authors' Form and Invoice for payment of the
>>>> grticle processing fee. After you make payment and send us

>> Authors'

>>>> Form, we will send you copy edited version of your text, for the
>>>> final

>>>> gpproval.

>>>>



w Yohanes Budiarto <yohanesb@fpsi.untar.ac.id>

to ojpr, bcc: me «

Dear Dear Goran PeSi¢
COAS Editorial Council

Attached is the author's form for publication. | hope this would meet the publication processes. Thank you

Yours sincerely
Yohanes Budiarto

One attachment - Scanned by Gmail

Authors’ Forn

itle of mamuseript:

First name:
Lasrname:

OJPR authors for... '



